



May 8, 2008

M E M O R A N D U M

TO: District Board of Trustees
FROM: William D. Law, Jr., President
RE: Attorney Invoices

Attorney invoices totaling \$1,689.20 are recommended for approval as detailed on the following pages.

Attorney fee totals for: FY07-08
\$42,473.00

Staff Resource: Teresa Smith.

RECOMMENDED ACTION: Authorize payment of invoices as presented.

Johnson, Farrell & Mabile, LLC

115 N. Calhoun Street
Tallahassee, FL 32301
Tax ID # 11-3799979

April 1, 2008

Billing through

03/31/2008

Invoice# 770 WRM

Our file# T00007 02276

Tallahassee Community College
Jerry Schilling
Assistant VP for Administrative Services
444 Appleyard Drive
Tallahassee, FL 32304-2895

Tallahassee Community College - General Business

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

03/04/2008	WRM	0.20	hrs.	25.00
Telephone conference with K. Nerona-Balog re: G.E.D.student judicial question;				
03/06/2008	WRM	0.40	hrs.	50.00
Telephone conference with J. Murdaugh re: employee issue (.2); Receipt and review of e-mail from R. Murgu re: visiting Chinese professor (.1); E-mail to K. Blizzard re: visiting Chinese professor (.1);				
03/07/2008	WRM	0.90	hrs.	112.50
Receipt and review of e-mail from K. Blizzard re: visiting professor (.1); E-mail to R. Murgu re: visiting professor (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from R. Murgu re: visiting professor (.1); Telephone conference with R. Tolson re: employee issues (.3); Receipt and review of board agenda for March 17, 2008 (.3);				
03/12/2008	WRM	0.10	hrs.	12.50
Receipt and review of e-mail from K. Blizzard re: Visa for visiting professor;				
03/17/2008	WRM	1.40	hrs.	175.00
Telephone conference with R. Tolson re: adjunct faculty hours (.2); Attend Tallahassee Community College board meeting (1.2);				
03/18/2008	WRM	1.80	hrs.	225.00
Receipt and review of e-mail R. Johnston re: proposed legislation (.1); E-mail to B. Sloan re: 780 hour rule for retired/rehired faculty (.1); Review and analysis of proposed legislation - charitable campaign for local public employees per R. Johnston (.8); E-mail to R. Johnston re: proposed legislation (.1); Three telephone conferences with R. Tolson re: employee administration re: hearing (.4); Telephone conference with R. Johnston re: proposed legislation (.2); Receipt and review of e-mail from B. Sloan re: 780 hour rule (.1);				
03/18/2008	SEO	0.70	hrs.	87.50
Research and analysis of proposed legislation for R. Johnston (SB 1576);				

T00007	Tallahassee Community College	Invoice# 770	Page 2
03/20/2008	WRM	2.60 hrs.	325.00
<p>Telephone conference with B. Law re: employee action (.2); Receipt and review of correspondence from B. Law re: employee action (.1); Telephone conference with P. Warmack re: employee action (.1); Review and analysis of employee leave and action (1.8); E-mail to R. Tolson re: employee action (.1); Telephone conference with R. Tolson re: employee action (.2); Receipt and review of e-mail from R. Tolson re: employee action (.1);</p>			
03/21/2008	WRM	2.20 hrs.	275.00
<p>Review and analysis of sub-contract agreement Tallahassee Community College and University Central Florida re: Workforce (1.2); E-mail to R. Frazier re: sub-contract agreement Tallahassee Community College and University Central Florida - Workforce (.1); Analysis case law re: employee action (.6); Dictation and preparation of correspondence to B. Law re: employee actions (.3);</p>			
03/21/2008	JS	2.50 hrs.	100.00
<p>Tallahassee Community College FMLA research;</p>			
03/24/2008	WRM	0.40 hrs.	50.00
<p>Receipt and review of e-mail from R. Frazier re: Workforce agreement - University Central Florida (.1); Receipt and review of two e-mails from R. Johnston re: Tallahassee Community College and Leon County Schools agreement (.2); E-mail to R. Johnston re: Tallahassee Community College and Leon County Schools agreement (.1);</p>			
03/25/2008	WRM	0.80 hrs.	100.00
<p>Telephone conference with R. Johnston re: Whole Child Leon non-disclosure agreement (.2); Receipt and review of e-mail from R. Johnston re: non-disclosure agreement (.1); Receipt and review of Tallahassee Community College and Leon County School Board Field Experience Agreement (.4); E-mail B. Sloan re: Tallahassee Community College and Leon County School Board Field Experience Agreement (.1);</p>			
03/26/2008	WRM	0.20 hrs.	25.00
<p>Receipt and review of e-mail from B. Sloan re: field experience agreement with Tallahassee Community College and Leon County School Board (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from B. Lesko re: field experience agreement Tallahassee Community College and Leon County School Board (.1);</p>			
03/31/2008	WRM	1.00 hrs.	125.00
<p>Receipt and review of two e-mails from K. Nerona - Balog re: SHS contract, list of incoming students (.2); Review Tallahassee Community College SHS marketing agreement for response to K. Nerona-Balog injury (.2); E-mail to K. Nerona-Balog re: SHS and Tallahassee Community College accounting agreement (.1); Receipt and review of two e-mails from R. Johnston re: Leon county Schools non-disclosure agreement (.2); Two e-mails to R. Johnston re: Leon County School non-disclosure agreement (.2); E-mail to J. Wahlen re: Tallahassee Community College and Leon County School non-disclosure agreement (.1);</p>			

Total Fees

\$1,687.50

EXPENSES

03/03/2008	E101	Copy Charges - 1 copies at .10 each	0.10
03/03/2008	E101	Copy Charges - 4 copies at .10 each	0.40
03/14/2008	E101	Copy Charges - 12 copies at .10 each	1.20

Total Expenses

\$1.70

Billing Summary - Summary by Timekeeper

Oole, Steve E.	0.70 hrs	125.00 /hr	\$87.50
Mabile, William R.	12.00 hrs	125.00 /hr	\$1,500.00
Spier, Jeremy	2.50 hrs	40.00 /hr	\$100.00
TOTAL	15.20 hrs		\$1,687.50

Total fees for this matter	\$1,687.50
Total disbursements for this matter	\$1.70
Total balance now due	\$1,689.20

Fees Billed Fiscal Year to Date	42,473.00
Expenses Billed Fiscal Year to Date	525.65
Fees Received Fiscal Year to Date	40,785.50
Expenses Received Fiscal Year to Date	523.95