



February 16, 2009

**M E M O R A N D U M**

**TO:** District Board of Trustees  
**FROM:** William D. Law, Jr., President  
**SUBJECT:** Attorney Invoice

---

Attorney invoices totaling \$5,095.60 for the period December 1, 2008 through December 31, 2008 are recommended for approval.

Attorney fees paid in fiscal year 2008-09 through January 31, 2009 total \$50,324.65.

Details are attached for information purposes.

STAFF RESOURCE: TERESA SMITH

RECOMMENDED ACTION:  
Authorize payment of invoices as presented.

# Johnson, Farrell & Mabile, LLC

115 N. Calhoun Street  
Tallahassee, FL 32301  
Tax ID # 11-3799979

January 14, 2009  
Billing through 12/31/2008

Invoice# 1177 WRM  
Our file# T00007 02276

Tallahassee Community College  
Jerry Schilling  
Assistant VP for Administrative Services  
444 Appleyard Drive  
Tallahassee, FL 32304-2895

Tallahassee Community College - General Business

## PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

12/01/2008	WRM	4.90	hrs.	612.50
Receipt and review of e-mail C. Brewer re: Portofino Security Company claim (.1); E-mails (2) to C. Brewer/ M. Turnbull re: Portofino Security Company claim (.3); Review e-mail from J. Schilling re: IKON agreement (.1); E-mail to J. Schilling re: IKON agreement insurance provisions (.2); Review e-mail from M. Turnbull re: Portofino Security Company claim (.1); Analysis re: Community College organization questions, issues, law (4.1);				
12/02/2008	WRM	4.20	hrs.	525.00
Review e-mail from M. Turnbull re: Portofino Security Company claim (.1); Continued analysis of Community College organization, employees, rules, strategies (2.5); Dictation and preparation of analysis of Community College organization, employees, rules, strategies (1.6);				
12/03/2008	WRM	5.30	hrs.	662.50
Brief scan of document received from Department of Financial Service re: workers compensation claim (.2); E-mail to J. Murdaugh and R. Tolson re: documents received re: workers compensation claim (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from J. Murdaugh re: documents received re: workers compensation claim (.1); Dictation and preparation of correspondence to J. Murdaugh and R. Tolson re: documents received re: workers compensation claim (.2); Receipt and review of e-mail from R. Tolson re: documents received re: workers compensation claim (.1); Receipt and review of e-mails (2) from R. Frazier re: contract copyright production (.2); Receipt and review of e-mail from B. Lesko re: FAMU/FGLSAMP Agreement (.1); Complete analysis of community college and employee organization relationships (4.1); E-mail to R. Frazier re: contract copyright protection (.1); Telephone conference with R. Frazier re: contract copyright protection (.1);				
12/04/2008	WRM	3.60	hrs.	450.00
Review FAMU/FGLSAMP program contract (.5); Review HP MESA Grant (.3); E-mail to T. Smith re: HP MESA Grant (.2); Two e-mails to B. Lesko re: FAMU/FGLSAMP Program contract (.2); Dictation and				

Invoice#	Page
T00007 Tallahassee Community College	1177 2
preparation of correspondence to J. Schilling re: copyright attorney invoice (.2); Telephone conference with R. Frazier re: copyright protection question (.2); Analysis of public entity relationship with employees (.6); Two telephone conferences with L. Kling re: meeting with B. Law (.2); Receipt and review of two e-mails from T. Smith re: HP MESA Grant (.2); Receipt and review of e-mail from T. Gray re: whistleblower litigation (.1); Receipt and review of two e-mails from B. Lesko re: FAMU/FGLSAMP Agreement (.2); Receipt and review of University N. Texas and ONCORE Project Agreement (.4); Emails (2) to T. Smith re: University N. Texas and ONCORE Project Agreement (.3);	
12/04/2008 SEO	1.70 hrs. 212.50
Research re: complications from pregnancy as a disability under the ADA and reasonable accommodation;	
12/05/2008 WRM	3.50 hrs. 437.50
Receipt and review of e-mail from T. Smith re: HP MESA Grant (.1); Analysis of TCC Foundation subject to Section 768.28, Fla. Stat. (1.3); E-mail to T. Smith and J. Schilling re: TCC Foundation subject to 768.28 (.2); Telephone conference with B. Law re: employee organization (.2); Analysis of CEO role re: ongoing negotiations (.7); Dictation and preparation of correspondence to B. Law re: CEO role in negotiations (.3); Analysis of FMLA leave, medical complications, return to work, disability (.5); Telephone conference with R. Tolson re: employee time sheets (.2);	
12/07/2008 WRM	0.80 hrs. 100.00
Review e-mail from B. Jones re: IKON contract (.1); Review e-mail from T. Smith re: BBSOA contract (.1); Review and analysis of BBSOA contract (.3); Dictation and preparation of correspondence to T. Smith discussing BBSOA contract (.3);	
12/08/2008 WRM	3.50 hrs. 437.50
Receipt and review of two e-mails from T. Smith re: telecommute contract (.2); Receipt and review of two e-mails from K. Nerona-Balog re: NSCH agreements (.2); Receipt and review of e-mail from B. Sloan re: copyright policy (.1); Receipt and review of motion to dismiss whistleblower complaint (.2); Three e-mails to T. Gray re: motion to dismiss (.3); Analysis of NSCH agreement (.5); E-mail to K. Nerona-Balog re: NSCH agreements (.1); Receipt and review of two e-mails from R. Tolson re: employee claim (.2); E-mail to R. Tolson re: employee claim (.1); Receipt and review of two e-mails from T. Gray re: motion to dismiss whistleblower claim (.2); Review and analysis of Telecommute contract and policy (.8); Analysis of copyright policy (.4); E-mail to B. Sloan re: copyright policy (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from R. Bush re: motion to dismiss whistleblower claim (.1);	
12/09/2008 WRM	0.60 hrs. 75.00
Receipt and review of e-mail from B. Ellison re: contract information in whistleblower claim (.1); Telephone conference with R. Tolson re: several personnel questions (.2); Analysis of employee exempt/non-exempt status (.3);	
12/10/2008 WRM	0.70 hrs. 87.50

T00007	Tallahassee Community College	Invoice# 1177	Page 3
	Receipt and review of e-mail from J. Schilling re: IKON contract (.1); Review Exhibit A of IKON contract (.1); E-mail to J. Schilling re: IKON contract (.1); Receipt and review of notice of hearing in whistleblower case (.1); E-mail to M. Haney re: Ghazvini Health Education Center lease (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from M. Haney re: Ghazvini lease (.1); E-mail to T. Stallworth re: Ghazvini lease (.1);		
12/11/2008	WRM	0.20 hrs.	25.00
	Receipt and review of e-mail from T. Stallworth re: Ghazvini Health Education Center site drawing (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from B. Jones re: IKON agreement (.1);		
12/12/2008	WRM	4.50 hrs.	562.50
	Two telephone conferences with R. Tolson re: workers' compensation claim (.3); Review portions of workers' compensation file re: disposition of claims (.8); Receipt and review of e-mail from C. Easley re: computer training agreement (.1); Review DMS computer training agreement (.3); E-mail to C. Easley re: DMS computer training agreement (.1); Review and analysis of all current proposed IKON agreement documents (2.3); E-mail to B. Jones, T. Smith and J. Schilling re: IKON agreement (.1); Receipt and review of two e-mails from J. Murdaugh re: Fire Academy contract (.2); Review Fire Academy contract (.3);		
12/15/2008	WRM	1.50 hrs.	187.50
	Telephone conference with R. Tolson re: workers' compensation claimant (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from B. Jones re: IKON agreement (.1); Receipt and review of two e-mails from K. O'Connor re: IKON agreement (.2); Receipt and review of e-mail from F. Weiner re: IKON agreement (.1); Two telephone conferences with J. Schilling re: IKON agreement insurance (.3); Review revisions to IKON agreement (.3); E-mail to B. Jones, T. Smith and J. Schilling re: IKON agreement indemnification and insurance provisions (.4);		
12/16/2008	WRM	0.60 hrs.	75.00
	Receipt and review of two e-mails from K. Nerona-Balog re: student information request with attachments (.3); Review FERPA re: student information requirement (.2); E-mail to K. Nerona-Balog re: student information request (.1);		
12/18/2008	WRM	2.00 hrs.	250.00
	Receipt and review of Pennington law firm's invoice for B. Hollimon's copyright work (.1); Dictation and preparation of correspondence to J. Schilling re: Pennington firm's invoice (.1); Dictation and preparation of legal opinions re: IKON agreement (.2); Review e-mail version of IKON agreement and related documents (.4); E-mail to B. Jones re: final version of IKON agreement (.1); Two telephone conferences with G. Chatani re: request for employee information (.3); Telephone conference with R. Tolson re: employee complaint (.2); Review two e-mails from R. Tolson re: employee complaint (.2); E-mail to T. Gray re: whistleblower complaint (.1); Review e-mail from J. Schilling re: IKON agreement (.1); E-mail to J. Schilling re: IKON agreement (.1); Review e-mail from T. Gray re: whistleblower complaint (.1);		
12/19/2008	WRM	0.90 hrs.	112.50

E-mails to and from J. Schilling re: Pennington firm invoice (.2); Analysis of board member voting conflict disclosure (.4); E-mails to and from L. Kling re: vote abstention (.3);

12/22/2008 WRM 0.40 hrs. 50.00  
E-mails to and from B. Jones re: IKON agreement and legal opinion letter;

12/30/2008 WRM 1.40 hrs. 175.00  
Receipt and review of FCHR/DOAH documents re: employee complaint (.4); Telephone conference with T. Brooks re: employee complaint (.2); Review three e-mails from K. Nerona-Balog re: request for student records (.3); Two e-mails to K. Nerona-Balog re: request for student records (.2); Telephone conference with C. Davis re: request for student records (.2); Review and sign response to DOAH's initial order (.1);

**Total Fees** \$5,037.50

EXPENSES

12/04/2008 E101 Copy Charges - 581 copies at .10 each 58.10

**Total Expenses** \$58.10

Billing Summary - Summary by Timekeeper

Oole, Steve E.	1.70 hrs	125.00 /hr	\$212.50
Mabile, William R.	38.60 hrs	125.00 /hr	\$4,825.00
<b>TOTAL</b>	<b>40.30 hrs</b>		<b>\$5,037.50</b>

**Total fees for this matter** **\$5,037.50**

**Total disbursements for this matter** **\$58.10**

**Total balance now due** **\$5,095.60**