



May 18, 2009

MEMORANDUM

TO: District Board of Trustees
FROM: William D. Law, Jr., President
SUBJECT: Attorney Invoices

Item Description:
Request for approval to pay the Board's Attorney.

Overview:
On a monthly basis, the Board's Attorney submits an invoice for services provided.

Salient Facts:
The College's Attorney is hired by the Board under the authority of Section 1001.64(25), Florida Statutes, and for this reason invoices are brought for approval.

Past Actions:
Attorney fees and expenses charged in fiscal year 2008-2009, through April 30, 2009 total \$84,069.80.

Future Actions:
Monthly invoices will be presented as they are submitted by the Attorney.

Funding/Financial Matters:
Funding is budgeted in Fund 1, the Current Unrestricted Fund. The current amount due is \$15,328.10.

Staff Resource:
Teresa Smith

Recommended Action:
Authorize payment of invoices as presented.

ANDREWS, CRABTREE, KNOX & ANDREWS, LLP

P.O. BOX 12800
TALLAHASSEE, FL 32309
TAX ID #59-3621660

May 4, 2009

Jerry Schilling
Vice President for Administrative Services
Tallahassee Community College
444 Appleyard Drive
Tallahassee, FL 32304

Invoice# 8324 WRM
Our file# T00007 02276
Billing through 04/30/2009

Tallahassee Community College (General)

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

03/25/2009	WRM	Receipt and review of e-mail from D. Heekin re: faculty organization (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from J. Schilling re: public record request (.1); Review public records request for Highway Safety Government Program records (.1); Receipt and review of Answer/Defenses filed by Portofino in security company suit (.3); E-mail to R. Johnston/M. Turnbull re: status of security company lawsuit (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail R. Johnston re: status of security company lawsuit (.1); Analysis of public records request - highway safety grant programs (.5); Telephone conference with J. Schilling re: public record request for highway safety grant programs (.2); Analysis - employee contracts (.4);	1.90 hrs.	237.50
03/27/2009	WRM	Receipt and review of e-mail from R. Buchanan re: motion to dismiss security company lawsuit (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from S. Hill re: Yellow Pages Agreement (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from D. Heekin re: faculty organization (.1); Email to S. Hill re: Yellow Pages Agreement (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from S. Hill re: TCC Springtime (.1); Receipt and review of UFF motion to schedule hearing outside time period (.1); Telephone conference with C.	0.80 hrs.	100.00

Proctor re: faculty organization (.2);

03/30/2009	WRM	Telephone conference with R. Tolson re: several employee issues;	0.30 hrs.	37.50
03/31/2009	WRM	Receipt and review of order re: substitution of counsel (.1); Receipt and review of e-mails (3) from D. Heekin re: faculty organization (.3); E-mail to D. Heekin re: faculty organization (.1); Telephone conferences with J. Schilling re: project insurance (2 calls) (.3); Receipt and review of e-mail to D. Heekin re: faculty organization (.1); E-mail to D. Heekin re: faculty organization (.1); Telephone conferences with B. Hollimin re: Indn. Lrn. plans copyright (.2); E-mail to B. Sloan re: MESA sub-agreement (.2);	1.40 hrs.	175.00
04/01/2009	WRM	Receipt and review of e-mails (2) from B. Sloan re: Mesa subagreement (.2); E-mail to B. Sloan re: Mesa subagreement (.1); Telephone conference with D. Heekin's office re: faculty organization (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from D. Heekin re: faculty organization with PERC documents (.2); Telephone conference with B. Law, D. Heekin, B. Sloan re: faculty organization (.5);	1.10 hrs.	137.50
04/02/2009	BJL	Review and analysis of statutes re: vendor contract with Subway to determine whether the contract could be rescinded, cancelled or was voidable;	1.20 hrs.	150.00
04/02/2009	WRM	Receipt and review of e-mails (2) from D. Heekin re: faculty organization with consent election form and bargaining unit (.4); E-mail to D. Heekin re: faculty organization, consent election (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from D. Heekin re: faculty organization, ballots (.1); Telephone conference with C. Proctor's office re: PERC filing (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from B. Law re: faculty organization (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from H. Campbell re: faculty organization (.1);	5.50 hrs.	687.50

Receipt and review of e-mail from T. Smith re: vendor lease (.1); Telephone conference with T. Smith re: vendor lease (.1); Review vendor lease documents (.1); Receipt and review of e-mails (6) from D. Heekin re: faculty organization (.6); Receipt and review of e-mail from D. Heekin re: faculty organization and proposed advertising policy with policy (.2); Telephone conferences with T. Smith re: professional services (4 calls) (.6); Telephone conference with C. Proctor re: faculty organization (.2); Telephone conference with D. Heekin re: faculty organization (.2); Continued analysis of administrative issue per B. Law (2.5);

04/03/2009	WRM	<p>Receipt and review of e-mails (2) from R. Johnston re: intellectual property (.2); E-mail to R. Johnston re: intellectual property (.1); Dictation and preparation of correspondence to B. Law re: administrative issue (.3); Receipt and review of e-mail from T. Brooks re: faculty organization (.1); Telephone conferences with J. Schilling re: board agenda item and insurance coverage question (2 calls) (.4); Receipt and review of e-mail from B. Law re: compensation questions (.1); E-mail to B. Law re: compensation questions (.1); Analysis re: J. Schilling questions board agenda item (.3); Analysis of MESA Agreement - insurance and indemnity (.3); Dictation and preparation of correspondence to B. Sloan with modification to MESA subagreement (.6); Review proposed legislation re: Community College employee contracts (.5); Telephone conference with B. Mullowney re: proposed legislation (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from T. Smith re: vendor contracts (.1); Telephone conferences with T. Smith re: vendor lease (.6); Analysis of vendor leases, lease history (1.3);</p>	5.10 hrs.	637.50
04/06/2009	BJL	<p>Review and analysis of vendor contract to determine whether the contract could be</p>	4.50 hrs.	562.50

rescinded, cancelled or was voidable (2.0);
 Review and analysis of salary cap legislation
 (2.5);

04/06/2009	WRM	<p>Telephone conference with R. Tolson re: DOAH matter (.1); E-mail to R. Tolson re: DOAH matter (.1); Receipt and review of e-mails (2) from R. Johnston re: video tutorials project (.2); Dictation and preparation of correspondence to R. Buchanan re: Family Network security motion to dismiss (.3); Receipt and review of non-employees/adjunct employee agreements to Video Tutorial project with G. Smith e-mail (.2); E-mail to R. Johnstone re: Video Tutorial project (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from C. Dominguez re: SACS policy (.1); E-mail to B. Law re: SACS policy (.1); Telephone conference with B. Lesko re: MESA project (.1); Analysis - current legislative bill - re: employee compensation (.9); Analysis of vendor contract issues (.8); Receipt and review of e-mail B. Law re: SAC's policy (.1); Receipt and review of e-mails (2) from M. Turnbull re: Network Family Security case (.2); E-mail to M. Turnbull re: Network Family Security case (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from B. Sloan re: SAC's policy (.1);</p>	3.50 hrs.	437.50
04/07/2009	BJL	<p>Prepare memo re: constitutionality of Florida Legislature proposed legislation that would place a cap on contractual salary agreements (1.0); Research re: requests for information (.6);</p>	1.60 hrs.	200.00
04/07/2009	WRM	<p>Telephone conference with B. Mallowsey re: pending legislation re: employee compensation (.1); E-mail to M. Turnbull re: Network Family Security matter (.1); Conference with T. Smith, J. Murdock, T. Stallworth re: development partner, continued conference with T. Smith and T. Stallworth re: vendor lease (1.8); Receipt and review of e-mails (4) from D. Heekin with stipulation of facts re:</p>	4.50 hrs.	562.50

faculty organization (.5); E-mail to D. Heekin re: stipulation of facts re: faculty organization (.1); Telephone conference with S. McKenzie re: employee compensation (.3); E-mail to B. Law re: analysis of employee compensation question (.3); Receipt and review of return mail - complaint in DOAH matter (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from T. Brooks re: stipulation of facts - faculty organization (.1); Telephone conference with B. Lesko re: MESA project (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from M. Turnbull re: pleadings to date in Network Family Security matter (.1); Analysis pending legislation re: employee compensation (.6); Preparation for meeting with T. Smith/J. Murdock re: development parties (.3);

04/08/2009	BJL	Research re: request for information (.3); Review and analysis of Florida Statutes re: restraints or procedures to follow in order to issue a request to negotiate to construct new infrastructure (1.0);	1.30 hrs.	162.50
04/08/2009	WRM	Receipt and review of e-mails (2) from R. Johnston re: Network Family Security matter (.2); E-mail to R. Johnston re: Network Family Security matter (.1); Receipt and review of request for information documents (.2); E-mail to T. Smith re: request for information (.1); E-mail to M. Moore re: Ghazvini lease (.1); Receipt and review of e-mails (2) from M. Moore re: Ghazvini lease (.2); E-mail to M. Haney re: Ghazvini lease (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from D. Heekin re: faculty organization (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from R. Tolson re: DOAH matter (.1); Telephone conferences with R. Tolson re: DOAH matter (.2); Receipt and review of e-mail from T. Smith re: development partners (.1); E-mail to T. Stallworth re: Ghazvini lease (.1); Telephone conference with R. Tolson re: several employee issues (.3); Telephone conference with L. Mathis re: FCHR	2.40 hrs.	300.00

complaint (.1); Receipt and review of e-mails (3) R. Tolson re: employee issue (.3); E-mail to R. Tolson re: employee issue (.1);

04/09/2009	WRM	Receipt and review of e-mail to T. Smith re: request for information, development partners with three attachments (.3); Receipt and review of e-mail from B. Sloan re: taping conversations (.1); Analysis of Chapter 287 and RFI process (.4); E-mail to T. Smith re: Chapter 287 and RFI process (.2); Review individual lrn plans project document for today's meeting (.4); Conference with T. Smith, B. Campman, B. Hollimon re: Individual Lrn Plan project, continued conference with T. Smith re: lease and employee issue (1.8); Receipt and review of e-mail from B. Hollimon re: Individual Lrn Plans project (.1); Telephone conference with T. Gray re: Whistleblower's claim (.3); Telephone conferences with B. Muldowney re: employee compensation (2 calls) (.4); E-mail to L. Mathis re: FCHR claim (.1); Analysis re: taping conversations (.8); E-mail to B. Sloan re: taping conversations (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from T. Gray re: Whistleblower claims (.1); Telephone conference with B. Abner re: Family Network Security Matter (.2); Receipt and review of e-mail from T. Smith re: Gear Up contract (.1); E-mail to R. Johnston/M. Turnbull re: Network Family Security matter (.1); Receipt and review of College Board Agreement (.5); E-mail to T. Smith re: College Board Agreement (.1);	6.10 hrs.	762.50
04/10/2009	BJL	Research case law to determine whether taping phone conversations or club meetings without permission constitute a violation of Florida Statutes Section 934.03;	2.00 hrs.	250.00
04/10/2009	WRM	Receipt and review of e-mail from B. Sloan re: taping conversations (.1); Receipt and review of motion, order and proposed order in	2.00 hrs.	250.00

Whistleblower cases (.3); E-mail to B. Sloan re: dental evaluation agreement (.1); Telephone conference with L. Kling re: President's contract (.1); Analysis of President's contract/proposed legislation (.5); Receipt and review of e-mail from L. Kling re: President's contract (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from S. Rowland re: class withdrawal (.1); E-mail to B. Law re: pending legislation compensation (.2); Analysis of withdrawal question (.3); Analysis of taping conversation (.2);

04/13/2009	BJL	Prepare memo re: legality of taping club activities and phone conversations without permission (.7); Review and analysis re: legality of taping club activities and phone conversations without permission (.8);	1.50 hrs.	187.50
04/13/2009	WRM	Telephone conference with S. Hall re: public records request (.1); E-mails (2) to S. Hall re: public records request (.3); Brief review of Chapter 119 re: public records request (.2); Receipt and review of Section 934.03 information, taping of conversations (.5); Receipt and review of e-mail from B. Law re: employee compensation (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from M. Turnbull re: security company suit (.1); E-mail to S. Rowland re: proposed withdrawal policy (.1); Telephone conference with S. Rowland re: proposed withdrawal policy (.2); Analysis of employee compensation (1.5); E-mail to B. Law re: employee compensation (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from B. Law re: employee compensation (.1); E-mail to T. Stallworth re: Ghazvini lease and vendor lease (.1); Receipt and review of e-mails (5) from S. Hall with 2 attachments re: public record request (.6); Dictation and preparation of correspondence to B. Sloan re: taping conversations (.3); Analysis of Chapter 287 - vendor lease (1.1); Analysis of class withdrawal questions (.6); Dictation and preparation of correspondence to D.	6.50 hrs.	812.50

Kearney re: class withdrawals (.3); Telephone conferences with T. Smith re: vendor lease (2 calls) (.2);

04/14/2009	WRM	Receipt and review of e-mails (2) from S. Jefferson re: late withdrawal (.2); E-mails (2) to S. Jefferson re: late withdrawal (.2); Receipt and review of e-mail from B. Hollimon re: trademark application for TCC (.1); E-mail to T. Smith re: Trademark application fee for TCC (.1); E-mail to B. Hollimon re: TCC Trademark application (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail to B. Sloan re: taping conversations (.1); Review class withdrawal question (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from T. Stallworth re: Ghazvini construction status (.1); E-mail to M. Haney re: draft lease - Ghazvini Health Education Center (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from L. Mathis re: FCHR complaint (.1); Telephone conference with L. Mathis re: FCHR complaint (.3); E-mail to L. Mathis re: FCHR complaint (.1); E-mails (2) to R. Tolson re: FCHR complaint (.2); Telephone conference with R. Tolson re: FCHR complaint (.2); Telephone conference with T. Gray re: FCHR complaint (.2); Receipt and review of e-mail from T. Gray's office re: Whistleblower claim (.1); Telephone conference with M. Moore re: Ghazvini lease (.3); Receipt and review of e-mail from R. Tolson re: FCHR complaint (.1);	2.70 hrs.	337.50
04/15/2009	BJL	Review and analysis of original language and changes to the language of Florida HB 995;	0.80 hrs.	100.00
04/15/2009	WRM	E-mails (4) to R. Tolson re: FCHR complaint (.4); E-mail to S. Hall re: public record request (.1); E-mails (2) to S. Jefferson re: late withdrawal question (.2); Receipt and review of e-mail from S. Hall re: public record request (.1); E-mails (2) to M. Moore re: Ghazvini lease (.2); Receipt and review of e-mail from S. Jefferson re: late withdrawal (.1); Receipt	5.60 hrs.	700.00

and review of e-mails (3) from D. Heekin re: faculty organization with proposed stipulation for consent election (.5); E-mails (2) to D. Heekin re: proposed stipulation for consent election (.2); Receipt and review of e-mails (3) from M. Moore re: Ghazvini lease (.3); Receipt and review of e-mails (4) from R. Tolson re: FCHR complaint (.4); Review and analysis of lease/deed other documents from Tallahassee Memorial Regional Medical Center attorney re: Ghazvini lease (2.2); E-mail to T. Stallworth re: Ghazvini lease (.1); Review 4/20/09 Board Agenda (.8);

04/16/2009	BJL	Review and analysis of options available to TCC for private development;	2.50 hrs.	312.50
04/16/2009	WRM	Review and analysis of proposed legislation re: Section 768.28 and application to community colleges (.5); Telephone conference with B. Law re: Ghazvini property, use of campus warehouses (.3); Analysis - Ghazvini lease (.3); Receipt and review of e-mail from T. Stallworth re: Ghazvini lease (.1); E-mail to T. Stallworth re: Ghazvini lease (.1); Telephone conference with J. Schilling re: proposed change to 768.28 (.1); E-mail to M. Moore re: Ghazvini lease (.1); E-mail to M. Haney re: Ghazvini lease (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from M. Moore re: Ghazvini lease (.1); Telephone conference with S. Mathew re: DOAH matter (.3); E-mail to B. Sloan/others re: DOAH matter (.1); Telephone conference with S. Mathew's office re: report to DOAH (.1); Receipt and review of joint report in DOAH matter (.1); Receipt and review of notice of appearance by S. Matthew for petitioner in DOAH matter (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from V. Mayes re: DOAH matter (.1); E-mail to V. Mayes re: DOAH matter (.1); Receipt and review of e-mails (2) from B. Sloan re: DOAH matter (.2); E-mails (2) to B. Sloan re: DOAH matter (.2); E-mails (2) to D. Heekin re: faculty organization (.2);	3.50 hrs.	437.50

Receipt and review of e-mail from D. Heekin re: faculty organization (.1); Telephone conference with T. Stallworth re: vendor lease and Ghazvini lease (.2);

04/17/2009	BJL	Review and analysis of potential options re: private development;	1.50 hrs.	187.50
04/17/2009	WRM	E-mail to M. Moore/M. Haney re: Ghazvini lease (.1); Email to T. Smith/T. Stallworth re: vendor lease (.1); Telephone conference with R. Tolson re: FCHR complaint (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from T. Smith re: vendor lease (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from M. Haney re: Ghazvini lease (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from S. Search re: DOAH matter (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from R. Tolson re: DOAH matter (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from D. Heekin re: faculty organization (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from B. Hebrock re: service contract (.1); Receipt and review of Hearing Officer's recommended order - faculty organization (.3); Receipt and review of 1996 RFP - re: vendor lease (.7); Telephone conference with L. Mathis re: FCHR re: complaint (.2); Receipt and review of e-mail from T. Stallworth re: Ghazvini lease (.1); Analysis of Florida Statute/F.A.C. vendor lease, construction lease (1.1); Analysis of vendor RFP, original lease, 3 amendments (1.1);	4.40 hrs.	550.00
04/20/2009	WRM	Dictation and preparation of correspondence to M. Donahue re: vendor lease (.4); Telephone conferences with L. Mathis re: FCHR matter (.3); Preparation for meetings today re: FCHR matter (.5); Conference with S. Jefferson, R. Tolson, R. Lipscomb, S. Couch re: FCHR matter (5.0); Review and analysis of notes from interviews re: FCHR matter (.5); Attend Board Meeting this date (1.4);	8.10 hrs.	1,012.50
04/21/2009	WRM	Telephone conference with R. Tolson re: FCHR Complaint (.1); Telephone conference	6.00 hrs.	750.00

with S. Jefferson re: FCHR Complaint (.1); Telephone conferences with E. Eunice re: trespass warning (.4); E-mail to S. Jefferson/R. Tolson re: FCHR Complaint (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from D. Heekin re: hearing officer's order (.1); Receipt and review of e-mails (4) from D. Heekin re: PERC election (.4); E-mails (3) to D. Heekin re: hearing affidavit order, PERC election (.3); E-mail to B. Law re: PERC election (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from R. Tolson re: FCHR complaint (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail to D. Heekin re: opinion in UF Faculty case (.1); E-mails to E. Eunice re: trespass warning (.3); Receipt and review of e-mail to T. Stallworth re: vendor lease (.1); E-mail to T. Stallworth re: vendor lease (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from B. Law re: early retirement options with attachment (.2); Receipt and review of e-mail from B. Hebrock re: services agreement (.1); Telephone conferences with L. Mathis re: FCHR Complaint (2 calls) (.4); Telephone conference with B. Law/D. Heekin re: PERC election (.9); Receipt and review of e-mail from B. Law re: PERC election (.1); Receipt and review of e-mails (2) from E. Eunice re: trespass warning (.2); Receipt and review of e-mail from S. Jefferson re: FCHR Complaint (.1); Receipt and review of DOAH scheduling order (.2); Receipt and review of documentation from E. Eunice re: trespass warning (.2); Telephone conference with B. Leinback - Board meeting public comment (.2); Receipt and review of PERC order re: bargaining unit (.1); Telephone conference with R. Tolson re: three employee issues (.4); Review service vendor invoice (.2); E-mail to B. Law re: service vendor invoice (.1); Analysis of vendor services "Florida Administrative Rules (.2); E-mail to T. Smith re: vendor lease (.1);

04/22/2009

WRM Receipt and review of e-mail from M. Haney

7.30 hrs.

912.50

re: Ghazvini lease lessor (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from T. Gray re: Whistleblower complaints (.1); E-mails (2) to T. Gray re: Whistleblower complaint (.2); Review and analysis of 2007 proposed/draft of Ghazvini lease (2.4); Receipt and review of e-mail from R. Tolson re: PERC Election Voting (.1); Review amended Whistleblower complaints (.4); Review policies, rules and statutes cited in amended Whistleblower complaint (.4); Receipt and review of e-mails (2) from B. Law re; faculty organization (.2); Receipt and review of e-mail from D. Heekin re: faculty organization (.1); Receipt and review of e-mails (2) from S. Hall re: grant program public records requests with attached e-mails (.3); Telephone conference with R. Tolson re: employee issue (.1); Analysis of request for grant program records (.4); E-mail to S. Hall re: analysis/recommendation on grant program public records request (.2); Telephone conference with M. Haney re: Ghazvini lease (.2); Receipt and review of attachments to e-mails from B. Law and D. Heekin re: faculty organization and PERC election (1.2); Analysis re: PERC election voting (.2); E-mail to R. Tolson re: PERC election voting (.1); E-mail to T. Stallworth re: Ghazvini letter (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from S. Search re: DOAH matter (.1); Review DOAH matter schedule - availability of witnesses (.2); E-mails (2) to M. Haney re: Ghazvini lease lessor (.2);

04/23/2009	WRM	Receipt and review of e-mail from T. Stallworth re: vendor lease (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from T. Smith re: services contract (.1); E-mail to T. Smith re: services contract (.1); Telephone conferences with V. Bahl re: grantee contract meeting (2 calls) (.3); Review and analysis of Grantee meeting contract and grantee lease with third party (.8); Receipt, review and analysis of	5.30 hrs.	662.50
------------	-----	---	-----------	--------

correspondence from A. Tappan (PERC) re: filings with PERC (.1); Receipt, review and analysis of correspondence from FCHR re: inquiry in FCHR matter, respond to inquiry (.2); Telephone conferences with R. Tolson re: 3 employees matters (2 calls) (.5); Receipt and review of e-mails (4) from D. Heekin re: PERC election (.4); E-mail to D.Heekin re: PERC election (.1); Analysis - DROP proposal (1.9); Receipt and review of e-mail from T. Smith re: 2 contracts (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from R. Tolson re: PERC election (.1); Receipt and review of e-mails (2) from T. Smith re: vendor lease (.2); E-mails (2) to T. Smith re: vendor lease (.2); E-mail to T. Stallworth re: vendor lease (.1);

04/24/2009	WRM	<p>E-mail to T. Smith re: retention of certain records (.1); E-mail to M. Haney re: Ghazvini lease (.1); Telephone conference with B. Avchen's office re: marketing agreement (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from M. Haney re: Ghazvini lease (.1); E-mail to T. Stallworth re: Ghazvini lease (.1); Receipt, review and analysis of curent professional services agreement to prepare new agreement (.4); Receipt and review of e-mails (3) from D. Heekin re: PERC election (.3); Receipt and review of e-mail from T. Stallworth re: Ghazvini lease (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from B. Avchen re: marketing agreement (.1); Telephone conferences with R. Tolson re: PERC election (2 calls) (.2); Review PERC elections eligible voter list (.1); E-mail to B. Sloan re: marketing agreement (.1); E-mail to T. Smith/V. Bahl re: grant sponsored event contract analysis (.5); E-mail to T. Smith/V. Bahl re: grantee premises lease (.3); Receipt and review of e-mail from V. Bahl re: grant sponsored event contract (.1); Continued analysis of DROP proposal (.3); E-mail to Bill Law re: DROP proposal (.2); Receipt and review of e-mails (2) from L.</p>	3.60 hrs.	450.00
------------	-----	---	-----------	--------

Kling re: letter from Attorney General (.2);
E-mail to L. Kling re: letter from Attorney
General (.1); Receipt, review and analysis of
correspondence from E. Friedman, Assistant
Attorney General re: retention of certain
purchasing records (.1);

04/27/2009	BJL	Prepare memo on options TCC has re: private development;	1.20 hrs.	150.00
04/27/2009	WRM	Receipt and review of e-mail from B. Sloan re: marketing agreement (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from J. Schilling re: document retention (.1); E-mail to J. Schilling re: document retention (.2); Receipt and review of e-mail from T. Smith re: document retention (.1); Revise professional services agreement (.6); Telephone conference with D. Heekin re: PERC election (.2); Receipt and review of e-mail from D. Heekin re: PERC election (.1); Receipt and review of PERC election rules, observer rules, notice requirements and sample ballot (.3);	1.70 hrs.	212.50
04/28/2009	BJL	Prepare memo on the options TCC has for private development;	0.30 hrs.	37.50
04/28/2009	WRM	Receipt and review of e-mail from J. Schilling re: lease renewal at FPSI (.1); Review and analysis of current sub-lease and extension - Air Methods Corporation (.7); E-mail to J. Schilling re: analysis of Air Methods Corporation Sub-Lease (.2); Receipt and review of e-mail from T. Smith re: vendor lease (.1); E-mail to T. Smith re: vendor lease (.1); Review revised professional services agreement (.2); Dictation and preparation of correspondence to T. Smith re: revised professional service agreement (.2); Receipt and review of e-mail from M. Haney re: Ghazvini lease (.1); E-mail to M. Haney re: Ghazvini lease (.1); E-mail to T. Stallworth re: Ghazvini lease (.1); Begin review of revised Ghazvini lease (.3); E-mail to T. Smith re:	2.30 hrs.	287.50

Ghazvini lease (.1);

04/29/2009	BJL	Review and analysis of case law and statutory language re: budget cuts, cost-cutting options available to TCC for budgetary cuts;	1.00 hrs.	125.00
04/29/2009	WRM	Receipt and review of e-mail from T. Smith re: Ghazvini letter (.1); E-mail to T. Smith re: Ghazvini lease (.1); Receipt and review of e-mails (3) from T. Smith re: contracts (.3); Receipt and review of e-mails (3) from R. Johnston re: Security Company suit (.3); Continue Initial review of revised Ghazvini lease (3.0); Attend PERC pre-election meeting (.8); Conference with R. Tolson re: employee issues, human resources policy (.4); Conference with T. Smith re: Ghazvini lease, professional services lease (.5); Receipt and review of e-mail from D. Heekin re: PERC eligibility list (.1); E-mail to T. Smith re: budget management question (.1); Receipt and review of e-mails (2) from T. Smith re: budget management questions (.2); E-mail to T. Stallworth re: Ghazvini lease (.1); E-mails (2) to R. Johnston re: security company suit (.2); E-mails (2) to M. Haney re: Ghazvini lease (.2); Receipt and review of e-mail from M. Haney re: Ghazvini lease (.1); E-mail to T. Smith/T.Stallworth re: Ghazvini lease analysis (.5); Review and analysis of UBC Agreement (.4); E-mail to T. Smith re: UBC Agreement (.1); Receipt and review of Metropolitan Hotel Contract for FIPSE Conference (.3); E-mail to T. Smith re: Metro Hotel Contract (.1); Receipt and review of Embassy Suites Agreement with comments (.3); E-mail to T. Smith re: Embassy Suites Agreement (.2); Receipt and review of e-mail from T. Smith re: Ghazvini lease (.1);	8.50 hrs.	1,062.50
04/30/2009	WRM	Receipt and review of e-mail from T. Smith re: hotel contracts (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from T. Smith re: CCLA/Ex Libris contract (.1); Receipt and review of CCLA/Ex	3.10 hrs.	387.50

Libris contract amendment (.3); E-mail to T. Smith re: CCLA/Ex Libris contract amendment (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from V. Vahl re: CCLA/Ex Libris contract amendment (.1); Receipt and review of Development Agreement (City) TMH (SCHS) first amendment to Agreement and proposed amendment to agreement (1.3); E-mail to T. Smith re: development agreement (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from T. Smith re: Volunteer Florida draft contract (.1); Review and analysis of Volunteer Florida draft contract (.4); E-mail to T. Smith re: Volunteer Florida draft contract (.1); Brief review of statutes cited in Volunteer Florida contract (.3); Receipt and review of e-mail from T. Smith re: Ghazvini lease (.1);

Fees for this matter \$15,325.00

DISBURSEMENTS

04/16/2009	Copy charges - 6 copies at .10 per copy	0.60
04/16/2009	Copy charges - 12 copies at .10 per copy	1.20
04/21/2009	Copy charges - 4 copies at .10 per copy	0.40
04/23/2009	Copy charges - 2 copies at .10 per copy	0.20
04/27/2009	Copy charges - 7 copies at .10 per copy	0.70

Disbursements for this matter \$3.10

BILLING SUMMARY

Longfellow, B. Joe	Associate	19.40 hrs	125.00 /hr	\$2,425.00
Mabile, William R	Attorney	103.20 hrs	125.00 /hr	\$12,900.00
Fees		122.60 hrs		\$15,325.00

Disbursements **\$3.10**

TOTAL CHARGES FOR THIS BILL \$15,328.10

Fees Billed Fiscal Year to Date	83,815.00
Expenses Billed Fiscal Year to Date	254.80
Fees Received Fiscal Year to Date	75,192.50
Expenses Received Fiscal Year to Date	254.65